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Frequently Asked Questions 
The S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Indices 

1. What are “dividend points”?  Index points refer to the level of an index. For example, if the 

S&P/ASX 200 is trading at 6,000, it is said to have a level of 6,000 points. Dividend points 

specifically refer to the level of index points that are directly attributable to the dividends of index 

constituents.  

2. What’s the difference between dividend points indices and other types of indices, like 

price return and total return indices?  Price return indices represent changes in the market 

capitalization of index constituents. They do not account for dividends. Total return indices 

reinvest dividends back into the index on the ex-date of each dividend paying constituent. Total 

return indices therefore represent changes in market capitalization plus reinvested dividends. 

Finally, dividend points indices track dividend payments in isolation, reflecting the periodic 

cumulative dividends of all index shares. They do not include any changes in market 

capitalization.  

One can think of the different types of indices as representing different investment strategies. 

Some market participants elect to reinvest dividends in the stocks they hold, and this strategy 

could be benchmarked with the S&P/ASX 200 (TR). On the other hand, some market 

participants hold stocks but do not reinvest dividends—electing instead to take dividends in 

cash as a source of income. This strategy could be benchmarked with a combination of the 

S&P/ASX 200 Price Return and the S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Indices.  

3. Why are there dividend points indices?  By offering an index that represents dividend 

payments of S&P/ASX 200 members, S&P Dow Jones Indices (S&P DJI) allows market 

participants to track an important component of equity returns—independently of equity price 

changes. The index can also be used as a basis for financial products.  

4. Can I invest in dividend points?  No, not directly. Like other indices, it is not possible to invest 

directly in dividend points indices.  

5. How many S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Indices are there?  There is one index that resets 

quarterly and one that resets annually. They are called the S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Index 

(Quarterly) and the S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Index (Annual).  

6. Why do the indices periodically reset to zero?  The indices represent cumulative cash 

dividends paid over a defined period, either one quarter or one year. At the start of the next 

period, the indices are reset to zero so that they reflect dividends paid in discrete periods that 

coincide with the expiration of S&P/ASX 200 futures. Having the indices reset when futures 

expire is useful, because it enables the indices to potentially be used as the underlying 

benchmark for financial instruments that could be designed to hedge periodic dividend risk of 

index futures.  

https://spindices.com/indices/equity/sp-asx-200
https://spindices.com/indices/equity/sp-asx-200-dividend-points-index-quarterly
https://spindices.com/indices/equity/sp-asx-200-dividend-points-index-quarterly
https://spindices.com/indices/equity/sp-asx-200-dividend-points-index-annual
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Resetting also allows for comparisons of dividend payouts and enables the measurement of 

changes in dividends from one period to another.  

7. When do the indices reset to zero?  The S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Index (Quarterly) 

resets after the market close on the third Thursday of the last month of each calendar quarter. 

This coincides with the S&P/ASX 200 futures expiration. The S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points 

Index (Annual) resets only on the third Thursday of December.  

8. How have S&P/ASX 200 dividends grown over the years?  Measured year over year, the 

annualized growth rate of dividends was about 3.3% for the five-year period from March 2014 to 

March 2019.  

9. How much of the total return of the S&P/ASX 200 has been due to dividends?  Over the 

same five-year period from March 2014 to March 2019, the S&P/ASX 200 (TR) grew about 

7.4% per year. Approximately 63% of this growth came from the reinvestment of dividends.  

10. What dividend payments are included in the S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Indices?  The 

indices represent regular cash dividends paid by S&P/ASX 200 constituents.  

11. Are special dividends included in the indices?  No, only regular cash dividends are included.  

12. Do dividends get counted on the ex-date or pay date?  Dividends are added on the ex-date. 

This is consistent with the S&P/ASX 200 (TR). Since stock prices are adjusted downward to 

account for dividends on the ex-date, this method is more straightforward than adding dividends 

on the pay date.  

13. How are the indices calculated?  On each trading day, S&P DJI sums the dividends of all 

index shares going ex-date and divides that figure by the S&P/ASX 200 divisor, which 

transforms the AUD value into index points. Dividend payments in other currencies are 

translated into AUD at the same exchange rate used for the total return index. Except for the 

reset day, these index points are added to the cumulative total for the respective period to 

derive the value of the S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Indices for that day.  

For more information on the S&P/ASX 200 Dividend Points Indices, please visit our website: 

www.spdji.com.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

S&P Dow Jones Indices does not give tax advice, and investors should consult with their own tax advisers 

regarding provisions applicable to them. 

http://www.spdji.com/
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GENERAL DISCLAIMER 

Copyright © 2019 by S&P Dow Jones Indices LLC. All rights reserved. Standard & Poor’s ®, S&P 500 ® and S&P ® are registered trademarks 
of Standard & Poor’s Financial Services LLC (“S&P”), a subsidiary of S&P Global. Dow Jones ® is a registered trademark of Dow Jones 
Trademark Holdings LLC (“Dow Jones”). Trademarks have been licensed to S&P Dow Jones Indices LLC. Redistribution, reproduction and/or 
photocopying in whole or in part are prohibited without written permission. This document does not constitute an offer of services in 
jurisdictions where S&P Dow Jones Indices LLC, Dow Jones, S&P or their respective affiliates (collectively “S&P Dow Jones Indices”) do not 
have the necessary licenses. All information provided by S&P Dow Jones Indices is impersonal and not tailored to the needs of any person, 
entity or group of persons. S&P Dow Jones Indices receives compensation in connection with licensing its indices to third parties. Past 
performance of an index is not a guarantee of future results. 

It is not possible to invest directly in an index. Exposure to an asset class represented by an index is available through investable instruments 
based on that index. S&P Dow Jones Indices does not sponsor, endorse, sell, promote or manage any investment fund or other investment 
vehicle that is offered by third parties and that seeks to provide an investment return based on the performance of any index. S&P Dow Jones 
Indices makes no assurance that investment products based on the index will accurately track index performance or provide positive 
investment returns. S&P Dow Jones Indices LLC is not an investment advisor, and S&P Dow Jones Indices makes no representation 
regarding the advisability of investing in any such investment fund or other investment vehicle. A decision to invest in any such investment 
fund or other investment vehicle should not be made in reliance on any of the statements set forth in this document. Prospective investors are 
advised to make an investment in any such fund or other vehicle only after carefully considering the risks associated with investing in such 
funds, as detailed in an offering memorandum or similar document that is prepared by or on behalf of the issuer of the investment fund or 
other vehicle. Inclusion of a security within an index is not a recommendation by S&P Dow Jones Indices to buy, sell, or hold such security, 
nor is it considered to be investment advice. 

These materials have been prepared solely for informational purposes based upon information generally available to the public and from 
sources believed to be reliable. No content contained in these materials (including index data, ratings, credit-related analyses and data, 
research, valuations, model, software or other application or output therefrom) or any part thereof (Content) may be modified, reverse-
engineered, reproduced or distributed in any form or by any means, or stored in a database or retrieval system, without the prior written 
permission of S&P Dow Jones Indices. The Content shall not be used for any unlawful or unauthorized purposes. S&P Dow Jones Indices and 
its third-party data providers and licensors (collectively “S&P Dow Jones Indices Parties”) do not guarantee the accuracy, completeness, 
timeliness or availability of the Content. S&P Dow Jones Indices Parties are not responsible for any errors or omissions, regardless of the 
cause, for the results obtained from the use of the Content. THE CONTENT IS PROVIDED ON AN “AS IS” BASIS. S&P DOW JONES 
INDICES PARTIES DISCLAIM ANY AND ALL EXPRESS OR IMPLIED WARRANTIES, INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, ANY 
WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE OR USE, FREEDOM FROM BUGS, SOFTWARE 
ERRORS OR DEFECTS, THAT THE CONTENT’S FUNCTIONING WILL BE UNINTERRUPTED OR THAT THE CONTENT WILL OPERATE 
WITH ANY SOFTWARE OR HARDWARE CONFIGURATION. In no event shall S&P Dow Jones Indices Parties be liable to any party for any 
direct, indirect, incidental, exemplary, compensatory, punitive, special or consequential damages, costs, expenses, legal fees, or losses 
(including, without limitation, lost income or lost profits and opportunity costs) in connection with any use of the Content even if advised of the 
possibility of such damages. 

S&P Global keeps certain activities of its various divisions and business units separate from each other in order to preserve the independence 
and objectivity of their respective activities. As a result, certain divisions and business units of S&P Global may have information that is not 
available to other business units. S&P Global has established policies and procedures to maintain the confidentiality of certain non-public 
information received in connection with each analytical process. 

In addition, S&P Dow Jones Indices provides a wide range of services to, or relating to, many organizations, including issuers of securities, 
investment advisers, broker-dealers, investment banks, other financial institutions and financial intermediaries, and accordingly may receive 
fees or other economic benefits from those organizations, including organizations whose securities or services they may recommend, rate, 
include in model portfolios, evaluate or otherwise address. 

ASX, ALL ORDINARIES are trademarks of ASX Operations Pty Ltd. and have been licensed for use by S&P Dow Jones Indices. 


